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CENTRAL KENTUCKY EDUCATION COOPERATIVE - TECHNOLOGY LINE ITEM BID
    JULY 1, 2007 - JUNE 30, 2008  

MFG VENDOR NAME

NUMBER UNIT DESCRIPTION OF PRODUCT Vendor - CDW-G
MEMORY/STORAGE Price Brand

EACH $41.88 Western Digital
EACH Internal Hard Drive 80GB $43.28 Western Digital
EACH Internal Hard Drive 120GB $53.38 Western Digital
EACH Internal Hard Drive 250GB $72.25 Western Digital
EACH External Hard Drive 40GB $62.03 Seagate
EACH External Hard Drive 80GB $81.03 Fantom
EACH External Hard Drive 120GB $83.50 Seagate
EACH External hard Drive 250GB $105.00 Simple
EACH Jump/Flash/Thumb Drive 1GB $14.38 Memorex
EACH Jump/Flash/Thumb Drive 2GB $18.00 Sandisk
EACH Jump/Flash/Thumb Drive 4 GB $38.00 Simple
EACH Jump/Flash/Thumb Drive 8GB $95.00 Edge
EACH Memory Cards/Sticks   512MB $19.60 Edge
EACH Memory Cards/Sticks   1GB $19.60 Edge
EACH Memory Cards/Sticks   2GB $39.60 Edge
EACH Memory Cards/Sticks 4GB $54.25 Transcend
EACH Memory Cards/Stick 8GB $84.00 Transcend
EACH Computer Memory RAM 128MB $24.00 Edge
EACH Computer Memory RAM 264MB $29.35 Edge
EACH Computer Memory RAM 512MB $45.03 Edge
EACH Computer Memory RAM 1GB $80.78 Edge
EACH Computer Memory RAM 2GB $159.60 Edge
EACH CDRW Drive $25.00 Sony
EACH DVDRW Drive $43.00
UNIT BLANK CDRW'S 50 pk   700MB $29.00
UNIT BLANK CDRW'S 100 pk No Bid
UNIT BLANK CDR'S 50 pk $11.00
UNIT BLANK CDR'S 100 pk $18.75
UNIT BLANK DVDRW'S 50 pk +/- $20.00 TDK
UNIT BLANK DVDRW'S 100 pk +/- No Bid
UNIT BLANK DVDR'S 50 pk  +/- $15.95
UNIT BLANK DVDR'S 100 pk  +/- $30.55

Vendor
HANDHELD DEVICES Price Brand

EACH Pocket PC $349.00 HP
EACH Palm Pilot $189.00 Palm

KEYBOARDS
EACH Microsoft Wireless Keyboard $40.00 Microsoft
EACH Microsoft Keyboard $14.25 Microsoft
EACH $22.00
EACH $7.65
EACH MAC Wireless Keyboard No Bid
EACH MAC Keyboard $19.00

Internal Hard Drive   40GB

LiteOn
Memorex

Memorex
Memorex

Memorex
Memorex

Logitech Wireless Keyboard Logitech
Logitech Keyboard Logitech

Macally
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CAMERAS
EACH Digital Camera  5 mega-pixels or greater $141.00 Canon
EACH Digital Camera  5 mega-pixels or greater $143.99 Sony
EACH Digital Camera  5 mega-pixels or greater $115.15 Nikon
EACH Digital Camera  5 mega-pixels or greater $95.75 Kodak
EACH Digital Camera  5 mega-pixels or greater $124.79 HP

MICE
EACH MICROSOFT INTELMOUSE OPTICAL MOUSE $30.00 Microsoft
EACH MICROSOFT WHEEL MOUSE $20.00 Microsoft
EACH MICROSOFT BASIC MOUSE $16.00 Microsoft
EACH MICROSOFT WIRELESS MOUSE $26.00 Microsoft
EACH LOGITECH WIRELESS MOUSE $19.19 Logitech
EACH LOGITECH BASIC MOUSE $5.75 Logitech
EACH MAC WIRELESS MOUSE $45.00 Macally
EACH MAC BASIC MOUSE $18.00 Macally

MISC. SUPPLIES
PS2 to USB Adaptors $2.20 Startech
CAT 6 Cable $4.27 Belkin
RJ45 Connectors $22.00 Belkin

ST TWO-WAY RADIOS $58.04 Motorola
EACH WIRELESS LAPEL MIC SYSTEM No Bid

TOTAL $2,984.82 

4 No Bid Items

**All Items must be NEW AND IN ORIGINAL UNOPENED PACKAGE; no refurbrished or remanufactured
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