
CKEC ATHLETIC MEDICAL SUPPLY BIDS JANUARY - DECEMBER  2005

GROUP 13 - MEDICAL SUPPLIES

Item
Brand/Model

A & D ointment, 4 oz tube 80 1.02
Acetaminophen x-strength (500) 100 BT 40 1.38
Adhesive foam

A.  1/8 x 6 x 72 40 5.22
B.  1/4 x 6 x 72 40 6.79

80 no bid
AIDS cleanup kits (Universal) 120 7.08

                                    
A.  Ankle 20 88.69
B.  Knee 20 50.42
C.  Shoulder 20 61.75
(Mayflower) 20 41.58

Airway kit 10 no bid
40 7.57

Alcohol, pint 16 oz 80 1.26
3/4 x 18, BX/12 20 8.12

15 discontinued
Ammonia spirits 2 oz 20 discontinued

A.  Ankle BOK A.  X-large 20 11.99
B.  Trim BOK B.  Large 20 11.99

C.  Medium 20 11.99
D.  Small 20 11.99
E.  X-small 20 11.99
(2x36) 20 15.05

Ankle stabilizer, Cramer                    
A.  Large 20 15.16
B.  Medium 20 15.16

Anti-itch spray 20 2.6
Anti-biotic ointment, triple                             

A.    1 oz tube 120 2.99
B.  10 oz tube 40 no bid
C.    1 lb jar 20 discontinued

Applicators BX/1000 20 4.22
Athlete's foot powder, 4 oz 40 2.99

Estimated 
Quantity Rnwl Price 07/08

           

Aeroseptics fast tape, 8 oz can

Air cast cryocuff

Air splint kit (adult 6 pc)

Alcare foam soap, 9 oz

Alumafoam finger splints
Ambu bags

Ankle brace, Swead, Mueller or 
ASO                                                 
                                                         
                

Ankle wrap, cloth, 2 x 72 yds
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Athletic tape (any)                                 Andover 1 x 15 yd rolls, 48 rolls/cs 40 cs 28.13
Athletic tape (any)                                 Andover                      

A.  1 1/2 x 15, 100 rolls/bx 80 bx 56.68
B.  2", 24 rolls/bx 60 bx 29.16

60 1.83
Individual packs 120 15.16

Band Aids Brand                                                                                         

A.  1", BX/100 120 3.75
B.  3/4 x 3, BX/100 40 2.79
C.  1 x 3/4, BX 1000 40 27.90
D.  2 x 4.5, BX/50 40 5.24
E.  Flex fingertips,   BX 100 60 5.61
F.  Flex knuckles, BX/100 40 5.88
G.  4 wing 20 5.88

Band Aids, Johnson & Johnson              
A.  1 x 3 sheer 120 3.16
B.  X-L, 2 x 4.5 60 5.24
(no weights) 20 296.30

Bar soap, 3 oz 72 case 20 23.79
BX/100 20 1.78

Blood pressure cuff 20 7.09
40 3.27

3 oz 40 5.55
Broken nose guard, clear 10 24.32
Butterfly closures Medium, BX/100 20 0.93

50 mg unit doses 20 39.03
Cold packs, instant 16 court case Hosp Mark 80 6.56

20 4.27
Cooler w/ screw top                                  

A.  3 gallon 20 23.48
B.  5 gallon 20 29.38
C.  7 gallon 20 48.51

Coolers, 5 gallon 10 29.38
20 discontinued

Corn and callous file 20 no bid
Cotton tipped applicators, N-S 6" BX/100 40 0.51
CPR XL Micro-shields 20 4.90
Cramer atomic balm, 16 oz 60 6.09

80 2.52
Cramer cinder suds, 5 oz spray 40 3.74
Cramer cold spray, 6 oz 40 4.51
Cramer firm grip                          

A.  4 oz spray 20 3.92
B.  4 oz powder 20 discontinued

Cramer junior soft-sided kit 20 66.51
Cramer pro-soft sided kit 20 83.92
Cramer JV medical kit filled, 17 items 20 80.77
Cramer varsity training kit filled 20 104.40
Cramer kit refill, 20 items 20 40.09
Cramer red hot, 2.75 oz tube 40 3.34
Cramer shark tape cutters 20 6.09
Cramer shark tape blades 80 1.79

Bactricin, .5 oz tube
Bactricin ointment

Beiresdorf

Baps board

Bee sting swaps, amuoles

Bloodbuster, 4 oz spray
Bloodclotter, hemo-stat sports spray

Chlorazene whirlpool antiseptic powder

Collyrium eye wash, 4 oz cup

Compeed, J & J

Cramer bactricin, 1 oz
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Cramer skin lube                      
A.  5 lb 20 18.08
B.  2.75 oz tube 80 2.52
                                                               

A.  4 oz 80 2.76
B. 10 oz 20 4.87
C.  8 oz aerosol 80 5.34
D. 10 oz aerosol 20 2.94

40
                    
A.  3 oz 80 no bid
B.  16 oz lotion/dispenser 20 no bid
                                                          

A.  1 lb 40 6.09
B.  5 lb 20 36.58
C.  2.75 oz 40 3.32

20 16.82
Crutches 20 18.11
Crutch arm cushions 20 1.64
Crutch hand grips 20 1.16
Cuff weights                                                                                                     

A.  1 lb 20 5.11
B.  2 lb 20 5.95
C.  3 lb 20 6.80
D.  5 lb 20 8.51
E.  7.5 lb 20 12.87

20 discontinued
20 83.13

Digit covers (PRO) 20 no bid
20 86.69

Digital thermometer 20 3.13
Dispenser bottle, 1 lb 20 no bid

20
no bid

Elastic wraps, deluxe                                                        

Single lengths A.  4", 12/bx 20 boxes 5.18/10 bx
B.  6", 12/bx 20 boxes 6.58/ 10 bx

Double lengths A.  4", 6/bx 20 boxes 8.64
B.  6", 6/bx 20 boxes 12.54

                       
20 boxes 12.02
20 boxes 12.02

                                
A.  2", 24 rolls/cs 20 cases 45.19
B.  3", 16 rolls/cs  20 cases 45.19

Cramer tuff skin, colorless

Cramer ultragel, 3 oz tube
Cramer ultragesic

Cramergesic 

Cramerol

Dacroise eye irrigation, 4 oz
Denison duke shoulder vest

Digital sling psycrometer

Duracold compression wraps for 
each shoulder/rotator cuff

Elasticon                       
                      
                      
                      
                      
                      

    

A.  2 x 5 yds, 6 rolls/bx
B.  3 x 5 yds, 4 rolls/bx

Elasticon speed pack
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40 5.05
Elbow support padded PPT 20 no bid
EMT scissors, 5 1/8" 20 1.27
English style ice caps, 9" 20 3.80

80 2.32
Examination gloves, latex                                                                          

A.  Small, Bx/100 20 2.35
B.  Medium, Bx/100 20 2.35
C.  Large 20 2.35
D.  X-large 20 2.65

20 5.98
Eye irrigate, sterile, 4 oz 40 1.45
Felt variety pack 20 5.81

                                                             

A.  PK-2 small kit 10 discontinued
B.  Granular fluid absorbent 10 3.99
C.  AT-6 athletic team pack 10 no bid
D.  P-1 first aid protection kits 10 no bid
E.  S-1 blood spill clean-up kit 10 no bid

Flax jacket, Adams 5 no bid
20 30.25

Foil rescue blanket, 56 x 86 20 0.69
Gauze pads, sterile, 100/bx                                                                         

A.  3 x 3 60 3.31
B.  3 x 4 40 7.18
C.  4 x 4 40 5.34
D.  J & J, 2 x 2 40 discontinued
E.  J & J, 4 x 4 40 discontinued

Gauze pads, non-sterile, 100/bx 3 x 3 40 1.14
Groin straps 20 19.99

20 discontinued
Heel and lace pads       

A.  3 x 4, 1000/cs 20 26.45
B.  4 x 4, 1000/cs 20  no bid

20
374.82

High density foam pads 20 no bid
High density foam rubber kit 20 11.39
Hot pack terry covers 20 10.49

             
A.  Standard 20 5.7
B.  Neck 20 6.79

20 1.1
Hydrogen peroxide, 16 oz 80 0.62
Inflatable vinyl splint, half-leg 20 6.22
Iodine solution 20 0.92

              
A.  Gallon 5 22.77
B.  Pint 40 4.84

Ivy dry cream, 1 oz 20 3.39

Elastomull sterile elastic gauze

Epson salt, 4 lb

Eyedrops, visine, 10 oz

First aid protection and blood 
exposure control kits

Flexiwrap w/handle, 6 rolls/bx

Handi-wipes, Sandi-dex

Hemo-flo 2 sequential 
compression kits

Hydrocallator steam packs

Hydrocortisone cream

Isoquin
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J & J Coach 100 cs 34.4
                               
A.  1", 12 rolls/bx 40 bx discontinued
B.  2", 12 rolls/bx 40 bx 8.63

80 discontinued
Jumper's knee sleeve 20 4.51
Knee brace, hinged                     

A.  Large 20 24.79
B.  Medium 40 24.79

Knee support, padded PPT 20 discontinued
Knowles bandage scissors 20 1.83

20 discontinued

Lister bandage scissors, 7.25" 20 2
Low tensile strength                      

40 cs 38.71
20 cs 38.71

10 30.23
              
A.  Small 20 14.11
B.  Large 20 14.11

20 6.2
20 7.9

Moleskin                          
A.  2" 20 8.28

20 11.15
                          

20 no bid
20 no bid
20 no bid

Mouth to mouth resuscitator 20 9.28
Mueller sports balm, 4 oz bottle 80 2.79

80 discontinued
Nasal sponges 40 13.61

80 6.26
                  
A.  4 oz 40 5.68
B.  8 oz aerosol 40 8.96

No-odor spray 40 4.17
4/bx 20 204.71

20 no bid
                      
A.  Individual, twin switch 10 2.04
 B.  Disposable, 6/pkg 10 4.88

10 23.18
Polar bear compression kits 20 no bid

60 cs 22.72
Pro formula trainer tape 60 cs 35.17

1 1/2 x 15 yds/roll, 32 rolls/cs

J & J Zonas

Jockitch powder, 4 oz

Kold wrap cold-compression 
bandage

                      
                      

  
A.  2x7, 1/2 yds, 24 rolls/cs

B.  3x7 1/2 yds, 16 rolls/cs

Matt-kleen, 1 gallon
McDavid ankle guard, A-101

McDavid knee support
McDavid ligament augmentation 
system

B.  3" x 25 yds
Moleskin Protek toe products

A.  2 x 25 yds
B.  1 1/2 x 25 yds
C.  3 x 25 yds

Murine, 1 oz

Neosporin ointment, 1 oz
Nitrotan

Orthoplast, 18 x 24 x 18 plain, 
Palumbo patella stabilizing brace
Penlite

Plastalume splints

Pre-wrap tape
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20 no bid

Protective goggles, eye injury 20 no bid
Protector pads, AC 20 no bid

Pro 12, Pro chin guard neoprene 
support
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A.  Firm 1 1/8" adhesive 20 no bid
B.  X-firm 1 1/8" adhesive 20 no bid
C.  High density, non-adhesive form u-pads 1 1/4"

20
no bid

Quick heat, 16/bx 20 11.68
Sam splint 20 6.88
Saunder's sport all back support 20 44.43

20 9.49
          
A.  #10 Blade 20 0.08
B.  #11 Blade 20 0.08

Scissor holster 20 3.37
Shoulder injury pads 20
Slings-loop arm Mesh 20 2.08
Specimen containers w/screw lid 4 oz 100 3.80

200/jar 20 19.22
16 oz 40 7.41

Spray tape adherent, QDA or STA8 oz 40 5.76
20 no bid

Sports rub, 1 lb. Dispenser bottle 10 no bid
Squirt bottles 100 no bid

100/bx 80 1.99
20 no bid

Stethoscope 5 2.76
Super foam kit 20 34.17
Superior position knee support 20 no bid
Tape remover, 10 oz spray 40 6.41

3 x 4, 100/bx 20 bx 9.90
3 x 4, 100/bx 30 bx 17.95

Temper stick form 20 33.01
               
A.  Green 20 7.05
B.  Red 20 6.71

Thermometer case 20 no bid
Thigh support 20 4.66

3.5 oz 20 discontinued
Toe caps Digit covers 20 6.64
Tongue blades, regular size 500 3.32
Trainer's Angel 20 34.23
U cartilage knee support 20 no bid
Ultra-gel, 3 oz 120 no bid

20 21.92
Universal lumbar support 20 20.12
Vacuum splint set, Rapid Form 20 248.85
Variable knee support 20 no bid
Vaseline intensive care, 24 oz 10 oz bottle 20 3.56

100 6.59
           

Proteck toe pads

Sav-a-tooth kit
Scapels, disposable

Spenco second skin, 1" sq
Spray Constat Clens wound cleaner

Sports Ortholic, Lynco 
Biomechanical

Steri-temp covers for digital
Sterilium

Telfa pads
Telfa pads, adhesive

Theraband, 6 yds.

Tinactin foot powder

Universal knee imobilizer

Vionex antimicrobial wipes, 50/bx
Vionex scrubcare
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hand gel A.  4 oz bottle 80 2.74
hand gel B.  18 oz bottle 20 6.77

500 1.17

Whirlpool antiseptic powder                                                   

A. 30 g/unit, 364/pk, 24-40 gal 100 no bid
B. 20 gm/unit, 24pk, 44-66 gal 100 19.20
C.80 gm/unit, 24pk, 77-116 gal 100 no bid

Wire basket w/6 qt bottles 20 20.64
Wood crutches, pr 20 8.54

20 no bid
Wound cleaner, 16 oz 20 7.41
Zinc oxide for abrasions, blisters           

A.  2 oz tube 80 1.46
B.  1 lb jar 20 6.41

Zip cut blades, 10/pkg 40 4.57
Zip cut tape cutter 20 2.57

Contact Info:

Melville, NY  11747
1-800-972-2611

Ref Bid CKEC #05-3000

**Discontinued Items for  06-07

Water squeeze bottle w/push-pull 
top

Wooten UHL 5 in 1 orthosis

Henry Schein Inc.
Linda Riccardulli
135 Duryea Rd.

Email:  linda.riccardulli@henryschein.com

Cramer 500 Tape & Tinactin Spray
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